
RESOLUTION NO. _______ 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF NAPA, STATE OF CALIFORNIA, ESTABLISHING, INCREASING AND DECREASING FEES FOR SERVICES PROVIDED BY THE CONSERVATION, DEVELOPMENT AND PLANNING DEPARTMENT – BUILDING AND PLANNING DIVISIONS; ENVIRONMENTAL MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT; AND DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS


WHEREAS, there is a need to establish, increase, and decrease the fees charged by the County of Napa to recover the costs of services provided by the Conservation, Development, and Planning Department – Building and Planning Divisions, Environmental Management Department, and Department of Public Works; and


WHEREAS, Chapter 12.5 of Part 1 of Division 2 of Title 5 of the California Government Code (commencing with Section 54985) and Chapter 8 of Division 1 of Title 7 of the California Government Code (commencing with section 66016) authorize the County to establish fees to recover the cost of providing a service; and


WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code section 66016, at least fourteen days prior to the date this resolution is to be considered, notice was mailed to those persons who had requested same; and


WHEREAS, notice of the hearing of the proposed fees was published twice in the manner set forth in section 6062a as required by section 66018, subdivision (a), of the Government Code; and


WHEREAS, pursuant to Government Code section 66016, at least ten days prior to the date this resolution is to be considered, data was made available to the public indicating the amount of cost, or estimated cost, required to provide the service for which the fee or service charge is levied and the revenue sources anticipated to provide the service, including general fund revenues;


NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of Napa as follows:

A.
The following fees and sections in Section III of the Napa County  Policy Manual, "Fees for Services Provided by County Departments and Agencies" are hereby added or amended as follows:

1.
Section 70.010 is hereby amended and a new Section 70.011 is hereby added to Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual to read as follows:

Sec. 70.010.  General.
The fees set forth in this Part shall be paid to the Building Division of the Conservation, Development and Planning Department prior to the issuance of permits authorizing construction, alterations or additions to or demolition of structures, plumbing, mechanical and electrical systems therein.
Sec. 70.011.  Definitions.
The following definitions shall apply to this Part 70:

“CBC” means California Code of Regulations Title 24 California Building Code Part 2 Volume 1

“CCR” means California Code of Regulations Title 24

“CEC” means California Code of Regulations Title 24 California Electrical Code Part 3

“CMC” means California Code of Regulations Title 24 California Mechanical Code Part 4

“CPC” means California Code of Regulations Title 24 California Plumbing Code Part 5.

2.
A new Section 70.015 is hereby added to Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual to read as follows:

Sec. 70.015.  Surcharge

In addition to the fees set forth in this Part, a General Plan surcharge of 1.7% as described in Section 80.015 shall be added to those fees is this Part 70 for services supported by the General Plan. The surcharge shall be added to the base fee amount.
3.
Sections 70.020 through 70.080 of  Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual are hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 70.020.  Fees; Building Permits. Fire Sprinkler Systems, and Inspections.
The following fees shall apply to issuance to building permits, fire sprinkler systems and inspections.

(a)
The following fees shall apply to issuance of Building Permits: 


TOTAL VALUATION

 FEE
$1.00 to $500.00

$ 24.80
$501.00 to $2,000.00

$ 24.80 for the first $500.00 plus $ 3.10 for each additional $100.00 or fraction thereof, to and including $2,000.00.

$2,001.00 to $25,000.00

$ 71.30 for the first $2,000.00 plus $ 14.10 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof to and including $25,000.00.

$25,001.00 to $50,000.00

$ 395.60 for the first $25,000.00 plus $ 10.15 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof to and including $50,000.00.

$50,001.00 to $100,000.00

$ 649.35 for the first $50,000.00 plus $ 7.05 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof to and including $100,000.00.

$100,001.00 to $500,000.00

$ 1,001.85 for the first $100,000.00 plus $ 5.65 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof.

$500,001.00 to $1,000,000.00
$ 3,261.85 for the first $500,000.00 plus $ 4.80 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof to and including $1,000,000.00.

$1,000,001.00 and up

$ 5,661.85 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus $ 3.10 for each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof.

(b)
The following fees shall apply to building permit related inspections and other activities, including inspections of fire sprinkler systems:

1.
Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charge--2 hours): $47.40 per hour

2.
Reinspection fees assessed under provisions of CDC section 108.8:  $47.40 per hour

3.
Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge one-half hour) 

           $ 47.40 per hour

4.

Plan Review fee when a plan or other data are required....................65%  of the Building Permit
submitted by Section 107.3 of CBC in subsection (a) above.
5.
Additional plan review required by changes, additions or  revisions to


approved plans (minimum charge one-half hour)....                                     $ 47.40 per hour

6.
The minimum building permit fee
...             $ 88.05
(issuance fee, and fees for plan review, strong motion, and energy plan review not included)

7.
For issuing each permit
........       $ 24.80
8.
(i)
Flammable liquid tanks for underground installation/removal:




less than 5,500 Gallons
.......
$ 47.40 ea




5,500 -10,000 Gallons
......
$ 67.70 ea




Over - 10,000 Gallons
......
$ 79.00 ea


(ii)
Flammable liquid tanks: for aboveground installation/removal:



   
Same as Building Permit fee in subsection (a) above

9.
Investigation fee for certification of dwelling as to code compliance:  $135.45 

10.
Microfilming - Plan Retention Fee (Health and Safety Code §19851)

The fee for microfilming building construction plans as required by section 19850 through 19853 of Chapter 10, Part 3  Division 13 of the Health and Safety Code shall be as follows:

(i)
Building Construction Plans - $1.00 per page.

(ii)
Specifications, Descriptions of Materials, Miscellaneous 8-1/2"x14" or 



smaller - $.40 per sheet.

(iii)
The minimum fee shall be $5.00.

11.
Whenever a project is “red-tagged” or otherwise found to be in violation of Title 15 of the Napa County Code, an investigation fee, in addition to the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued.  The investigation fee shall be two times the amount of the permit fee required by this code.  The payment of such investigation fee shall not exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

12.
When documentation demonstrating compliance with State energy conservation regulations is required, a fee shall be paid at the time of submitting such compliance documentation.  Such fee shall be 10% of the building permit fee shown in subsection (a).  This fee shall be in addition to the building permit fees and plan review fees required under this section.

13.
The fee for Planning Division review of a building permit clearance slip (ministerial project) is $173.00 per referral from the Building Division.
14.
The fee for Planning Division review of a building permit clearance slip (discretionary project), including site plan approvals, is $ 116.00 per hour ($ 464.00 deposit) for each referral from the Building Division.


15.
(i)

When a Certificate of Occupancy is required under CBC, the fee for processing and issuance therefor shall be $ 107.00


(ii)
The fee for Planning Division review prior to the issuance of a Certificate of Occupancy is $ 116.00 per hour after the first hour of review for each referral from the Building Division.


15.
The fee for issuing re-roofing permits shall be based on the verified contract amount and be calculated using subsection (a) of this section.  A plan review fee shall not be required for re-roof permit applications


Sec. 70.025.  Strong-Motion Instrumentation and Seismic Hazard Mapping Fee


(Public Resources Code Sec. 2705).


(a)
Category 1 Construction (1 to 3 Story Residential).  Category 1 construction includes residential buildings one to three stories in height, except hotels and motels.  Single family houses, duplexes and quadruplexes are included in Category 1.  Condominiums and apartment buildings are in Category 1 only if they are three stories or less in height.  The fee assessed for Category 1 construction is that amount calculated from the permit valuation  found in subsection (a) and using the formula as follows:




(Valuation Amount) X 0.0001 = Fee Amount



(b)
Category 2 Construction.  Category 2 construction includes all buildings not in Category  1.  Category 2 construction includes residential buildings over 3 stories, all office buildings, warehouses, factories and other manufacturing or processing facilities, restaurants, and other non-residential buildings.  The fee assessed for Category 2 construction is that amount calculated from the permit valuation found in subsection (a) and using the formula as follows:



(Valuation Amount) X 0.00021 = Fee Amount


(c)
For purposes of this section, "building" is as defined in section 203 of the CBC


Sec. 70.030.  Fees; Plumbing Permits and Inspections.

The following fees shall apply to the issuance of plumbing permits:


(a)

Permit Issuance

1.
For the issuance of  each plumbing permit
$ 24.80

2.
For  the issuance of each supplemental permit for which the original permit has not expired, been canceled or finaled...
$   7.30

(b)
Unit Fee Schedule  (Note:  The following do not include permit-issuing fee.)

1.
Fixtures and Vents

For each plumbing fixture or trap or set of fixtures on one trap (including water, drainage piping and backflow protection thereof).....................................................................   $ 9.85


For repair or alteration of drainage or vent piping, each fixture.....................................$  4.80

2.
Sewers, Disposal Systems and Interceptors


For each building sewer and each trailer park sewer ...................................................$ 24.80


For each cesspool ........................................................................................................  $ 37.50


For each private sewage disposal system......................................................................$ 75.05


For each industrial waste pretreatment interceptor including its trap and vent, 



excepting kitchen type grease interceptors functioning as fixture traps.......................$ 20.00


Rainwater systems-- per drain (inside building)...........................................................$   9.85

3.
Water Piping and Water Heaters


For installation, alteration, or repair of water piping or water-treating equipment, or both,



each.................................................................................................................................$  4.80


For each water heater, including vent............................................................................$ 12.40


For vents only, see section 70.040.


4.
Gas Piping Systems


For each gas piping system of one to five outlets........................................................ $  6.20


For each additional outlet over five, each....................................................................$  1.10

5.
Lawn Sprinklers, Vacuum Breakers and Backflow Protection Devices


For each lawn sprinkler system on any one meter, including backflow



protection devices therefrom........................................................................................$ 14.95


For atmospheric-type vacuum breakers or backflow protection devices not included in Item 1:



1 to 5 devices...........................................................................................................     $ 12.40


Over 5 devices, each...................................................................... ............                .$   2.25


For each backflow protection device other than atmospheric-type vacuum breakers:



2 inches (50.8 mm) and smaller............................................................................... .$ 12.40


Over 2 inches (50.8 mm).........................................................................................   $ 24.80

6.
Swimming Pools


For each swimming pool or spa



Public pool..............................................................................................................
$ 92.00


Public spa................................................................................................................
$ 61.25


Private pool............................................................................................................
.$ 61.25


Private spa..............................................................................................................
$ 30.45

7.
Miscellaneous


For each appliance or piece of equipment regulated by the CPC but not classed in other  appliance categories, or for which no other fee is listed in this code.....
.................$  9.85

(c)

The following fees shall apply to plumbing permit related inspections and other activities, 

1.
Inspections outside of normal business hours (minimum charge-two



hours)................................................................................................


$ 47.40 per hour


2.
Reinspection fee assessed under provisions of 103.5.6 CPC ...........


 $ 47.40 each

3.
Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated (minimum charge



one-half hour).................................................................................... 

$ 47.40 per hour

4. Additional plan review required by changes, additions, or revisions



to approved plans (minimum charge one-half hour)...................................$ 47.40  per hour


5.
Commercial and industrial fees.......$ 1.00 per $100.00 or fraction thereof of the verified contract price.


6.
The minimum Plumbing Permit fee (not including issuance fee).............................$ 39.50

Sec. 70.040.  Fees; Mechanical Permits and Inspections.

The following fees shall apply to the issuance of mechanical permits and inspections: 


(a)
Permit Issuance 

1.
For the issuance of  each mechanical permit  $ 24.80
2.
For issuing each supplemental permit for which the original permit has not expired, been canceled or finaled.... $  7.30

(b)
Unit Fee Schedule (Note: the following do not include permit-issuing fee.)

1.
Furnaces
For the installation or relocation of each forced-air or gravity-type furnace or burner, including ducts and vents attached to such appliance, up to and including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW).................$ 14.95
For the installation or relocation of each forced air or gravity-type furnace or burner, including ducts and vents attached to such appliance over 100,000 But/h(29.3 kW)...................
$ 18.35
For the installation or relocation of each floor furnace, including vent.....................
.$ 14.95
For the installation or relocation of each suspended heater, recessed wall heater or 

floor-mounted unit heater...............................................................................
.$ 14.95
2.
Appliance Vents
For the installation, relocation or replacement of each appliance vent installed and not included in an appliance permit.........................................................................$  7.30
3.
Repairs or Additions
For the repair of, alteration of, or addition to each heating appliance, refrigeration unit, cooling unit, absorption unit, or each heating, cooling, absorption or evaporative cooling system, including installation of controls regulation by the CMC........................$ 13.80

4.

Boilers, Compressors and Absorption Systems


For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor  to and including 3 horsepower (10.6 kW), or each absorption system to and including 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 KW)................
$ 14.85
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 3 horsepower (10.6 kW) to and including 15 horsepower (52.7 kW), or each absorption system over 100,000 Btu/h (29.3 kW) and including 500,000 Btu/h (146.6 kW)............................................$ 27.35
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 15 horsepower (52.7 kW) to and including 30 horsepower (105.5 kW), or each absorption system over 500,000 Btu/h (146.6 kW) to and including 1,000,000 Btu/h (293.1 kW)..........................$ 37.55
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 30 horsepower (105.5 KW) to and including 50 horsepower (176 kW), or each absorption unit over 1,000,000 Btu/h (293.1 kW) to and including 1,750,000 Btu/h (512.9 kW).............................$ 56.30
For the installation or relocation of each boiler or compressor over 50 horsepower (176 kW), or each absorption system over 1,750,000 Btu/h (512.9 kW)......................... $ 93.40

5.
Air Handlers
For each air-handling unit to and including 10,000 cubic feet per minute (cfm)(4719/Ls), including ducts attached thereto...................................................................$  10.70
Note:  This fee does not apply to an air-handling unit which is a portion of a factory-assembled appliance, cooling unit, evaporative cooler or absorption unit for which a permit is required elsewhere in the CMC.

For each air-handling unit over 10,000 cfm (4719 L/s)................................$ 18.60

6.
Evaporative Coolers
For each evaporative cooler other than portable type...................................
.$  10.70

7.
Ventilation and Exhaust
For each ventilation fan connected to a single duct...............................................
$  7.30
For each ventilation system which is not a portion of any heating or air conditioning system authorized by a permit.......................................................
$  10.70
For the installation of each hood which is served by mechanical exhaust, including the ducts for such hood.......................................................................................  10.70

8.
Incinerators
For the installation or relocation of each domestic-type incinerator............................
$ 18.35
For the installation or relocation of each commercial or industrial-type incinerator..
$ 75.05

9.
Miscellaneous
For each appliance or piece of equipment regulated by the CMC but not classed

in other appliance categories, or for which no other fee is listed in the table.............$ 10.70
(c)
The following fees shall apply to mechanical permit related inspections and other activities: 
1.
Inspections outside of normal business hours, per hour (minimum charge -2 hours):$ 47.40
2.
Reinspection fee assessed under provisions of  CMC Section 116.6 

$ 47.40 

3.
Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated, per hour


(minimum charge - one-half  hour).......................................................

$ 47.40 

4.
Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to plans or 


to plans for which an initial review has been completed


(minimum charge - one-half hour)....
$ 47.40
This fee includes supervision, overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved.

5.
Heating permit fees, electrical or gas, for dwellings, apartments and condominiums shall be $ 2.15 per 100 square feet or portion thereof of conditioned floor area.

6.
Commercial and industrial heating/cooling permit fees shall be $ 1.00 per $100.00 or fraction thereof  of the verified contract price.

7.
The  minimum Mechanical Permit fee (not including issuance fee) ......................... $ 39.50 

Sec. 70.050.  Fees; Swimming Pools, Spas.   Permits and Inspections
Notwithstanding any other provision in Part 70, only the following fees shall apply to permits issued and inspections made by the Building Division of the Conservation, Development and Planning Department for swimming pools and spas, whether public or private:

(a)

Building permits:



Permit fee varies with project cost - ...
see valuation in Section 70.020



Fee for issuing each permit........................................................................................
$ 24.80
Plan Check Fee:

A plan check fee equal to 65% of the Building Permit fee will be paid the FIRST time a pool contractor secures permits to construct  a pool in Napa County.  A copy of the pool company's approved master steel schedule will be filed and an  additional plan check fee of $ 23.70 will be required thereafter providing all permit applications thereafter contain the same approved copy of the steel schedule as on file with the Building Division.

(b)
Plumbing Permits: 

Permit fee - unheated pool
.........................................     $ 38.65
Permit fee - heated pool
.......................................        $ 61.25
Fee for issuing each permit.........................................................................................$ 24.80
(c)
Electrical Permits:

Permit fee - swimming pool...................
.......................................       .$ 49.95
Permit fee - Portable Spa.
.......................................       .$ 71.10
Fee for issuing each permit............................................................................................$ 24.80
(d)
Reinspection Fee (all categories)...............................................................................$ 47.40
Sec. 70.060.  Fees for Electrical Permits and Inspections
The following fees shall apply to the issuance of electrical permits and inspections:  

(a)
Permit Issuance
1.

For the issuance of each electrical permit......................................................................$ 24.80
2.
For the issuing of each supplemental permit for which the original permit has not expired, been canceled, nor finaled.................. .......................................................................... $  7.30
(b)
System Fee Schedule (Note: The following do not include permit-issuing fee)

1.

New Residential Buildings
The following fees shall include new wiring and all electrical equipment in or on each building, or other electrical equipment on the same premises constructed at the same time.

(i)
Multifamily.  For new multifamily buildings (apartments and condominiums) having three or more dwelling units constructed at the same time, not including the area of garages, carports and accessory buildings,but including all outlets, range, dryer and other miscellaneous circuits, the following flat rate shall apply: $ 3.35 per 100 square feet. 

Exception:  Electric heat will require a separate permit, for which the fee will be $ 2.25 per 100 square feet.

(ii)

Single-family.  For new construction work on single-family dwellings, including service, all outlets, range, dryer and other miscellaneous circuits, the following flat rate shall apply.....$ 2.25  per 100 square ft.




Exception:  Electric heat will require a separate permit, for which the fee will be $ 2.25 per 100 square ft.

(iii)

Two-family. For new two-family residential buildings constructed at the same time and not including the area of garages, carports and accessory buildings, per square foot: $  0.55
2.

Private Swimming Pools

For new private, in-ground swimming pools for single-family and multifamily occupancies including a complete system of necessary branch circuit wiring, bonding, grounding, underwater lighting, water pumping and other similar electrical equipment directly related to the operation of a swimming pool, each pool.......................................................$ 49.95
3.
Carnivals and Circuses
Carnivals, circuses, or other traveling shows or exhibitions utilizing transportable-type rides, booths, displays and attractions.
For electrical generators and electrically-driven rides, each......................................................

$ 24.80
For  mechanically-driven rides and walk-through attractions or displays having electric

lighting, each 


  $ 7.30


For a  system of area and booth lighting, each........................................................$ 7.30


For permanently installed rides, booths, displays and attractions, use the Unit Fee Schedule

4.

Temporary Power Service
For a temporary service pole or pedestal including all pole or pedestal-mounted receptacle outlets and appurtenances, each..........................................................................$ 24.80
For a temporary distribution system and temporary lighting and receptacle outlets for construction sites, decorative lights, Christmas tree sales lots, fireworks stands, etc., each......................$ 12.40
5.

Accessory Buildings, Equipment Buildings, Barns, Storage Sheds and Garages
For accessory buildings, equipment buildings, barns, storage sheds, garages, and similar structures, the following flat rate shall apply.................................$ 2.25 per 100 square feet

6.

Commercial Installations
For commercial installations, the fee shall be $ 1.40 per $100,000 or fraction thereof of the verified contract price

7.

Annual Electrical Maintenance
In lieu of an individual permit for each installation or alteration, an annual permit may upon application therefor, be issued to any person, firm or corporation regularly employing one or more electricians for the installation and maintenance of electric wiring, devices, appliances and equipment upon premises owned or occupied by the applicant.  The annual permit shall not authorize or include new installations in any building constructed or altered unless otherwise approved by the electrical inspector.  The application shall be made on forms furnished by the electrical inspector.  Each annual permit shall expire December 31st of the year in which it is issued.  The electrical inspector shall visit all premises where work has been done under annual permits and inspect all electric wiring, devices, appliances, and equipment installed under such a permit.  The fee for each such special annual permit...............

$ 141.10
(c)
Unit Fee Schedule (Note:  The following do not include the permit-issuing fee.)
1.

Receptacles, Switch and Light Outlets


For receptacle, switch, light or other outlets at which current is used or controlled, except services, feeders and meters:



First 20 fixtures, each.......................................................................................................$ 1.10


Additional fixtures, each.................................................................................................$   .70
Note:  For multi-outlet assemblies, each 5 feet (1524 mm) or fraction thereof may be considered as one outlet.

2.

Lighting fixtures


For lighting fixtures, sockets, or other lamp-holding devices:



For first 20 fixtures, each..................................................................................................$ 1.10


Additional fixtures, each...................................................................................................$   .70


For pole or platform-mounted lighting fixtures, each............................  ......................$ 1.10


For theatrical-type lighting fixtures or assemblies, each.........................  ....................$ 1.10
3.

Residential Appliances
For fixed residential appliances or receptacle outlets for same, including wall-mounted electric ovens; counter-mounted cooking tops; electric ranges; self-contained room, console or through-wall air conditioners; space heaters; food waste grinders; dishwashers; washing machines; water heaters; clothes dryers; or other motor-operated appliances not exceeding one horsepower (HP) 746 W) in rating, each.................................................................$ 4.80
Note:  For other types of air conditioners and other motor-driven appliances having larger electrical ratings, see Power Apparatus.

4.

Nonresidential Appliances
For nonresidential appliances and self-contained factory-wired, nonresidential appliances not exceeding one 
horsepower (HP), kilowatt (kW) or kilovolt-ampere (kVA), in rating including medical and dental devices; food, beverage and ice-cream cabinets; illuminated show cases; drinking fountains; vending machines; laundry machines; or other similar types of equipment, each........................................................$ 4.80
5.

Power Apparatus
For motors, generators, transformers, rectifiers, synchronous converters, capacitors, industrial heating, air  conditioners and heat pumps, cooking or baking equipment and other apparatus, as follows:

Rating in horsepower (HP), kilowatts (kW), kilovolt-amperes (kVA) or kilovolt-amperes-reactive (kVAR):



Up to and including 1, each.................................................................................$   4.80


Over 1 and not over 10, each...............................................................................$ 12.40


Over 10 and not over 50, each.........      ..............................................................$ 24.80


Over 50 and not over 100, each.............  ............................................................$ 49.95


Over 100, each.................................................. ...................................................$ 75.05
Notes:

(i)
For equipment or appliances having more than one motor, transformer, heater, etc., the sum of the combined ratings may be used.


(ii)
These fees include all switches, circuit breakers, contacters, thermostats, relays and other directly related control equipment.

6.

Busways

For trolley and plug-in-type busways, each 100 feet (30,480 mm) or fraction thereof:

                                                                                                                                $  7.30
Note:  An additional fee is required for lighting fixtures, motors and other appliances that are connected to trolley and plug-in-type busways.  A fee is not required for portable tools.

7.

Signs, Outline Lighting and Marquees
For signs, outline lighting systems or marquees supplied from one branch circuit, each:





$ 24.80


For additional branch circuits within the same sign, outline lighting system or marquee, each......$ 4.80
8.

Services
For services of 600 volts or less and not over 200 amperes in rating, each.............$  30.75
For services of 600 volts or less and over 200 amperes to 1,000 amperes, each......$  62.65


For services of over 600 volts or over 1,000 amperes in rating, each....................... $ 125.30
9.

Miscellaneous Apparatus, Conduits and Conductors
For electrical apparatus, conduits and conductors for which a permit is required but for which no fee is herein set forth...................................................................................$ 18.35
Note:  This fee is not applicable when a fee is paid for one or more services, outlets, fixtures, appliances, power apparatus, busways, signs or other equipment.

(d)
The following fees shall apply to electrical related inspections and other activities: 
1.

Inspections outside of normal business hours, per hour (minimum charge- 2 hours)..$ 49.95
2.

Reinspection fees assessed under provisions of Article 089.5 , per inspection...$ 49.95
3.

Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated,  
per hour (minimum charge - one-half hour)..................................................................$ 49.95
4.
Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to plans or to plans for which an initial review has been completed (minimum charge - one-half hour)....$ 49.95
(This fee includes supervision, overhead, equipment, hourly wages and fringe benefits of the employees involved)

5.

The minimum Electrical Permit fee (not including issuance fee)..........................$ 71.10
6.
Extra inspections for temporary heat shall be $ 47.40 per inspection, with a minimum of


$ 47.40 per call

7.
Investigation fees:  Whenever any work for which a permit is required under Chapter 15.28 of the Napa County Code has been commenced without the authorization of such permit, a special investigation shall be made before a permit may be issued for such work.  The fee for such investigation, which shall be in addition to the permit fee shall be two times the electrical permit fee.

8.
Time and Material Contracts:  For contractors engaging in time and material contract work, such that the proper permit fee for such work cannot be calculated in advance, shall pay the minimum fee of  $ 71.10 for a permit prior to beginning the job.  Upon completion of the contract, but prior to final inspection, the contractor shall notify the building inspector in writing of the maximum charges to be made under the time and material contract.  No final inspection shall be made prior to receipt of such notification and payment. The permit fee will be: $ 1.40 per $100.00 or fraction thereof, less the $ 71.10 initial fee.

9.
For change of location or replacement of equipment on the same premises, the fee shall be the same as that for a new installation.  However, no fee shall be required for moving any temporary construction motor from one place to another on the same site during the time of actual construction work after a permit has once been obtained.

10.
Trailer Park Exception:  None of the fees in this Section shall apply to trailer parks.  Fees for electrical installations in trailer parks shall be paid pursuant to the schedule set forth in “Rules and Regulations for Electrical Equipment and installations in Mobile Home Parks”, Title 25, Chapter 2, SubChapter 1, Article 3 of the California Code of Regulations.

Sec. 70.070.  Fees; Demolition Permits; Historic Structure processing fee

(a)
The fee for a demolition permit shall be the minimum Building Permit fee of $ 88.05 from section 70.010.15. 

(b)
 The fee to process any demolition permit for a designated historic structure is $ 200.95, which includes the cost of required publications and legal advertising.

Sec. 70.080.  Fees; Grading Plan Review.

See Public Works Fees, Section 140.025.

4.
Subsection (b) of Section 80.020 of  Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual, pertaining to fees to process applications for administrative zoning permits, is amended to read as follows:

(b)
Entry Structures and Fences                                                     
$   464.00
5.
Section 80.055 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended to read in full as follows:

Sec. 80.055. 

The fees to review erosion control plans prepared pursuant to the Conservation Regulations contained in the Napa County Code are as noted below. Where projects do not easily fall into one of the following categories, the Conservation, Development and Planning Director will determine which of the following categories most closely fits the project and assign the corresponding fee:

(a)
Structures only on slopes < 15% (standard measures plan)
$231.00

(b)
Structures only on slopes > 15% (includes inspection & annual monitoring
$1,350.00

(c)
Minor projects (e.g. swimming pools, retaining walls)
$636.00

(d)
Agricultural Projects (includes inspection & annual & long term monitoring)
*

(e)
Track II Vineyard Replants
$600.00

(f)

Erosion Control Plan Modifications (includes field modifications)
$400.00 plus consultant fee

(g)
Projects In Sensitive Drinking Water Supply Watersheds – Supplement
$607.00

(h)
Annual Monitoring – Supplemental Fee
$58.00

(i)

Multi-Year Projects – Supplemental Fee
$58.00

6.
A new subsection (r) is hereby added to Section 80.110 of  Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual, pertaining to fees to process use permits to read as follows:


(r) 
Home Occupation



   
$464.00
7.
Section 80.111 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended in full to read as follows:

Sec. 80.111.  Public Works Review of Various Permits.

The fees in this section are in addition to the other fees charged and collected by the Planning Department.

(a)
Annual Review of existing development agreement                                             
$225.00

(b)
Approval of Development Agreement (each submission)
 
                        
$283.00

(c)
Category 2B Event (51-99 attendees)                                                 

               $91.00
(d)
Category 3 Event (100-299 attendees)                                                                          
 $91.00
(e)
Category 4 Event (300 + attendees)                                                                          
$182.00

(f)

Child Day Care Center                                                                                                    $283.00

(g)
Extension of Time                                                                                                     
$182.00

(h)
Filing Within 60 Days of Event-Penalty                                                                  
$182.00

(i)

Ground Water Review                                                                                                        *

(j)

Name an Unnamed Private Road                                                                                   $197.00

(k)
Plan Amendment (text or map)                                                                                           *

(l)

Residential Care Facility (Medium or Large)                                                              $283.00

(m)
Review of EIR                                                                                                                 *

(n)
Temporary Trailer/Mobile home Permit (for each term of years)                           
$182.00

(o)
Variance authorized by the Napa County Code of Ordinance                                 
$182.00

(p)
Use Permits                                                                                                                
     *

8.
Subsection (b) of Section 80.135 of  Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual, pertaining to fees for consultations with Planning Staff is hereby amended to read as follows:

(b)
Pre-application Meetings                                                                                              
$ 116.00



Pre-Application Conference ( This fee is non-refundable 72 hours before meeting.)

9.
Subsection (i) of Section 80.200 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual , pertaining to fees for Zoning Clearances, Permit Clearances and ABC Licenses, is hereby amended to read as follows:


(i)

Grading Permit and Erosion Control Review (Public Works referral)

* 

10.
Section 80.210 of  Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 80.210.  Temporary Event  Fees.
(a)

The fee to process an application for a Category 2A  temporary event is $58.00.   

(b)

The fee to process an application for a Category 2B temporary event is $ 464.00.  

(c)

The fee to process an application for a Category 3 temporary event is $ 580.00.  

(d)

The fee to process an application for a Category 4 temporary event is $ 1,276.00.


(e)
The fee for subsequent events as defined in Chapter 5.36 of the Napa County Code is  $ 464.00.

11.
A new Section 110.23 is hereby added to Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual to read in full as follows:

Sec. 110.230
Stormwater Fees

The following annual fees are established for services relating to implementation of the stormwater inspection (NPDES) program as required pursuant to local city or county ordinances, where the services involved are provided by County personnel:

(a)

All food establishments (except restricted food service transient occupancy  establishments) as defined by the California Uniform Retail Food Facilities Law:
$59.00

(b)
All those businesses that at any time store Threshold Planning Quantity amounts of any class of hazardous material and/or have on file with the Department of Environmental Management a Hazardous Materials Business Plan, and/or generate any amount of hazardous waste:   $39.00
12.
Sections 140.010 and 140.011 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual are hereby amended in full to read as follows:

Sec. 140.010.  General.
The fees set forth in this Part shall be paid prior to processing the application for the permit or franchise.  No such permit, franchise, or other document shall be accepted for filing unless the fees are paid at that time.    Fees are either (1) a one-time fixed payment, or (2) based on actual cost of staff time utilizing a set hourly rate for the department which incorporates the overall cost of the County to provide this service; the latter of which is referenced as “Actual Time”.  Actual Time fees are marked with an asterisk (*).  The Public Works Director will provide a reasonable estimate of the cost of service covered by an Actual Time fee prior to the service being provided. The Actual Time rate for services provided by the Public Works Department shall be calculated as set forth in Section 140.011.

Sec. 140.011.
Actual Time Rate;  Fee for Additional Requested Services.

(a)
The Actual Time rate for services provided by the Public Works Department shall be one hundred thirty-five dollars ($135) per hour with a ½ hour minimum for each separate work event.  Actual Time shall be billed to the nearest half hour after the first hour.  A two (2) hour minimum payment shall deposited with the application or service request submittal.  Further deposits may be required pursuant to the estimated time to process the request for service. Excess fees shall be refunded when the services have been completed.  


(b)
 The fee to perform services requested of the Department by or on behalf of a member of the public which are not specifically described in this Part shall be charged at the Actual Time  rate  described in (a).
13.
Section 140.025 to Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec 140.025.
  Grading Permit
The fee to process a Grading Permit, and review for conformance with NPDES, if applicable, is     *

14.
Sections 140.070 through 140.074 to Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual are hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 140.070.  Land Divisions.
The fees to process applications relating to land divisions to be paid to the Department of Public Works, which are in addition to the fees required to be paid to the Conservation, Development and Planning Department, are as follows:

(a)
The fee for review by the Conservation, Development
 
$372.00




and Planning Department of a proposed Final Parcel Map



or Subdivision Map for Condition Compliance 



for each map referral from the Department of Public Works

(b) The fee for review by Public Works of a Tentative Final 

*


Map or Subdivision Map to assign conditions of approval for



Each map referral from Conservation , Development and Planning



Department

(c)
Lot Line Adjustments

$1,115.00

(d)
Minor Lot Line Adjustment

$270.00
(e)
Appeal Of Lot Line Adjustment

$1,347.00 



(This is in addition to the present fee collected by the Clerk



of the Board for processing  this appeal.)

(f)
Final subdivision  map filing





$1,296.00

(g)
Final parcel map filing






$910.00

(h)
Plan checking and final inspection including survey                    

$263.00



monuments 

(i)
Lot revision after checking





$340.00

(j)
Requests for extension of time to complete off-site 



improvements







$314.00

(k)
Amended final map filing

$701.00

(l)
Certificate of correction filing

 $7.00


  


                                                                             $3.00 each additional page
Sec. 140.071.  Improvement Plan Checking Fee

The fee to review improvement plans as required by use permit conditions of approval, and review for conformance with NPDES, if applicable

  
*
Sec. 140.072.  Building Permit Review Fee

The fee to review building clearance referrals, and review for conformance with NPDES, if applicable                                                                                                                             
 *
Sec. 140.073.  Technical NPDES Review for Agricultural Erosion Control Plan 

The fee  for the Public Works Department to provide technical NPDES review for Agricultural Erosion Control Plans is
  *
Sec. 140.074.  Post Construction Stormwater Permit 

$270.00
15.
Section 140.081 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended to read as follows:


Sec. 140.081.  Corner Records.


The fee charged for a Corner Record is

$7.00







$3.00 each additional page

16.
Section 140.110 of Section III of the Napa County Policy Manual is hereby amended in full to read as follows:

Sec. 140.110.  Certificates of Compliance.
The following schedule of fees shall apply, with all such fees payable to, and partial refunds (if any) made by, the Napa County Department of Public Works.  As provided in Chapter 17.52 of Napa County Code, the Department of Public Works shall distribute the following amounts, to cover the costs of the services provided by the noted departments and agencies as applicable:

(a)
Conditional Certificates of Compliance

(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application


$3,734.00

(2)
Department of Public Works, for notice and publication costs

$     50.00

(3)
Department of Conservation, Development and Planning, for


environmental review of Conditional Certificates

$  380.00

(4)
Napa County Counsel, for legal review

$  485.00

(5)
Napa County Assessor, for map changes [Policy Manual Section

40.120(a)]

$  415.00

(6)
Napa County Recorder, for handling fee for processing Fish &


Game CEQA fee (Policy Manual Section 90.045)

$    35.00

(7)
Napa County Recorder, for recording Certificate or Conditional


Certificate for one parcel.

$    13.00

(8)
Napa County Recorder, for recording Certificates or Conditional


Certificates with more than one parcel:                  

$3.00 per additional parcel

(9)
California Department of Fish and Game, for CEQA review


Fish & Game Code Section 711.4(d)

$1,250.00

The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be

$6,362.00
(b)
Unconditional Certificate of Compliance (the numbers refer to the number of the fees in (a) imposed for this type of application):

(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application


$3,734.00

(4)
Napa County Counsel, for legal review

$  485.00

(5)
Napa County Assessor, for map changes Policy Manual Section 40.120(a)
$  415.00
(7)
Napa County Recorder, for recording Certificate or Conditional


Certificate for one parcel.

$    13.00

(8)
Napa County Recorder, for recording Certificates or Conditional



Certificates with more than one parcel:                  

$3.00 per additional parcel

The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be

$4,647.00
(c)
Denied Certificate of Compliance (the numbers refer to the number of the fees in (a) imposed for this type of application):
(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application


$3,734.00

(4)
Napa County Counsel, for legal review

$  485.00

The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be

$4,219.00

(d)
Abandoned Certificate of Compliance (the numbers refer to the number of the fees in (a) imposed for this type of application):
(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application



$3,734.00

(4)
Napa County Counsel, for legal review

$  485.00

The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be

$4,219.00
(e)
Application for Corrected Certificate or Conditional Certificate.  The total fee to be paid to the Department of Public Works at the time of filing an application for a corrected Certificate or Conditional Certificate under Section 17.52.045 of the Napa County Code is the total of the following amounts.  From this fee, the Department of Public Works shall distribute the following amounts to cover the costs of the services provided by the noted departments and agencies, except that no such distribution shall be made of the items noted with an asterisk ** and such amounts shall be refunded to the applicant if the application is denied:



(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application
   $ 458.00



(2)
Napa County Assessor, for map changes [Policy Manual




Section 40.120(a)]

** $ 415.00



(3)
Napa County Recorder, for recording corrected Certificate or




Conditional for one parcel

** $   13.00



(4)
Napa County Recorder, for recording a corrected Certificate







or Conditional Certificates with more than one parcel.    ** $3.00 per additional parcel



The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be


$886.00

(f)
Application for Amended Conditional Certificate.  The total fee to be paid to the Department of Public Works at the time of filing an application for an amended Conditional Certificate under Section 17.52.046 of the Napa County Code is the total of the following amounts.  From this fee, the Department of Public Works shall distribute the following amounts, to cover the costs of the services provided by the noted departments and agencies, except that for the items noted with an asterisk *** no such distribution shall be made and such amounts shall be refunded to the applicant if the application is denied:



(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application
   
$  640.00



(2)
Department of Public Works, for notice and publication costs
   
$    50.00



(3)
Department of Conservation, Development and Planning, for




environmental review of amended Conditional Certificate
   
$  180.00



(4)
Napa County Counsel, for legal review
   
$    80.00



(5)
Napa County Assessor, for map changes [Policy Manual




Section 40.120(a)]
*** $  415.00



(6)
Napa County Recorder, for handling fee for processing Fish &




Game CEQA fee [Policy Manual Section 90.045]
*** $    35.00



(7)
Napa County Recorder, for recording amended Conditional




Certificate for one parcel
***$    13.00



(8)
Napa County Recorder, for recording amended Conditional




Certificates with more than one parcel:              *** $3.00 per additional parcel



(9)
California Department of Fish & Game, for CEQA review




[Fish & Game Code Section 711.4(d)]
***$1,250.00



The total fee deposit (one parcel) shall be

$2,663.00

(g)
Application for Recording Notice of Satisfaction or Supercession of Conditions of Conditional Certificate.  The total fee to be paid to the Department of Public Works at the time of filing an application for recordation of a Notice under Section 17.52.040 that the conditions of development set forth in a recorded Conditional Certificate have been satisfied or superseded by the conditions in a recorded final map, parcel map, or lot line adjustment is the total of the following amounts.  From this fee, the Department of Public Works shall distribute the following amounts to cover the costs of the services provided by the noted departments and agencies, except that for the item noted with an asterisk **** no such distribution shall be made and such amount shall be refunded to the applicant if the application is denied:

(1)
Department of Public Works, for processing application
  
$    343.00

(2)
Napa County Recorder, for recording Notice

****$7.00

The total fee deposit shall be


  
      $350.00

(h)
        [Reserved.]

(i)
Expedited Certificates Of Compliance. 

$343.00

If the Application for an Expedited Certificate of Compliance is denied because the property does not meet the criteria for a legal lot as described in Section 17.02.320 (A)(7), (A)(8), or (A)(9), such fee will be refunded  to the applicant pursuant to Section 17.52.011(D). 

j.
Appeal Of Certificate Of Compliance

$820.00


(This is in addition to the present fee collected by the Clerk


of the Board for processing  this appeal.)

B.
The fees set forth in (A), above, shall become effective on the 61st day following adoption of this resolution, in accordance with section 66017, subdivision (a), of the Government Code.

C.
The Board finds this resolution is categorically exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act pursuant to Title 14, California Code of Regulations, section 15273(a)(1) and (2) because the amounts of the fees imposed do not exceed the reasonable cost of the labor, equipment and materials for the services being provided.


THE FOREGOING RESOLUTION WAS DULY AND REGULARLY ADOPTED by the Board of Supervisors of the County of Napa, State of California, at a regular meeting of the Board held on the 13th day of July 2004, by the following vote:

     
AYES:
  SUPERVISORS   
__________________________________

                                    
__________________________________

    
NOES:
SUPERVISORS   
__________________________________

       
ABSENT:  
SUPERVISORS   
__________________________________



__________________________________


  
MARK LUCE, Chairman of the Board of





Supervisors

ATTEST: PAMELA A. MILLER

Clerk of the Board of Supervisors

By:_____________________       

APPROVED AS TO FORM

Office of County Counsel

By: Margaret Lee Woodbury,        Chief Deputy County Counsel
Date: July 2, 2004

APPROVED BY THE NAPA COUNTY

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

  Date:   ________________________

Processed by:

______________________________
Deputy Clerk  of the Board

Highlighting means new or modified text or amount








PAGE  
1
h:\ccoun\docs\Building\CDPD-ENV MGMT                                                                                                  7-2-04

-PW OR Fees Res - t.doc


